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Date: 30 April 2009
Our ref:
Your ref:

ENGLAND

Ashdown House

6 Floor

123 Victoria Street
London

SWA1E 6DE

Dear Mr Bruton
Access to Information Request — internal Review

Thank you for your email, received on the 3™ March 2009, requesting an internal review of the
reply to yous. 21 Qctober 2008 requests. | have reviewed the Refusal Notice in relation to the
provision of information in accordance with the Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (the
Regulations).

| have reassessed the 5 questions you posed and our answers and have set out below my
findings. My decision following review, is that your request of the 21* October was correctly dealt
with except in relation to one email which was previously withheld. A copy of that email is
enclosed with this letter.

Questions 1-3

1. “l request... .. any letters/email, notes etc (including hand written file notes)
regarding the Oyster Unit/Fishery in your/NE’s possession — since 1* October 2008 —
specifically including the minutes of the 15 October Meeting with the EA in Truro.”

2. Who attended that meeting [15 October 1008] and who was invited and may not have
attended the meeting?

3. Can you confirm that you have provide me with all documentation related to the
Oyster Unit/Fishery since my email of 22/9 — including all notes, minutes of
telephone calls to all bodies involved? ’

We have previously provided you with all the information that we hold in relation to these requests

including the list of participants. We do not hold minutes of the meeting and therefore, under

Regulation 12(4)(a) it is information not held.

Question 4

4, Have for example any documents/notes which exist/existed, been omitted in error?

At the time of the response you had been previously provided with all information that Natural
England holds in relation to this question.
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5. Have you or NE had ahy contact with the Duchy of Cornwall itself in the past 6
months? if so please provide details.

Natural England holds three documents that relate to this period. They are in effect an exchange
of emails between Roger Covey, our Senior Marine Specialist, and the Duchy of Cornwall. | have

careful considered these documents and feel &;at we should continue to withhold two of them ™ ‘
however | have determined as part of my review email dated 23 July 2 oger

Covey and the Duchy should not have been withheld. As stated above, a copy of that email is
enclosed. As regards the remaining two documents | have determined that we should continue to
withhold them. The reasons for this decision are set out beiow.

Regulation 12(5)(b)

Regulation 12(5)(b) states that a “...public authonty may refuse to disclose information to the
extent that its disclosure would adversely affect -

(b) the course of justice, the ability of a person to receive a fair trial or the ability of a public
authority to conduct an enquiry of a criminal or disciplinary nature;”

In light of the current litigation between yourself, the Duchy of Cornwall and Natural England we
are of the opinion that the release of these documents would adversely affect the course of justice
in that they relate to matters that are in issue in those proceedings and in particular matters in
issue between yourself and the Duchy of Cormwalk

| am of the view that this exception applies and having applied the presumption set out in
Regulation 12(2), nonetheless believe that Natural England is correct to withhold this information
as the public interest in maintaining the exception outweighs the public interest in disclosure. It is
in the public interest that the litigation referred to is properly disposed of as its subject matter is the
provisions and proper application of legislation directed at conserving the nature conservation
interest in sites of national and European importance. It is vital that this legislation is properly
applied in order that the public interest in conserving these sites can be pursued.

Regulation 12(5)(f)

The documents are also being withheld under the exception in Regulation 12(5)(f) which states
that "...a public authority may refuse to disclose information to the extent that its disclosure would
adversely affect —

(f) the interests of the person who provided the information where that person -

()  was not under, and could not have been put under, any legal obligation to supply it to
that or any other public body;

(i)  did not supply it in circumstances such that that or any other public body is entitled
apart from these Regulations to disclose it; and

(iii}  has not consented lo its disclosure.”

All three of the conditions provided at paragraph (f) have been met in this case. These documents
contain legal advice and opinion and the Duchy of Cornwall, who provided Natural England with.
legat opinion it had received, does-net consent to its release. Disclosure of the information would
adversely affect the interests of the provider of the information, as it would prejudice its ability to
pursue its interest in the resolution of the matters in issue in the proceedings referred to above.
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Regulation 12(2), nonetheless believe that Natural England is correct to withhold this information
as the public interest in maintaining the exception outweighs the public interest in disclosure. It is
in the public interest that Natural England is able to maintain a free flow of information between it.
and those that own land in Sites of Special Scientific Interest or whose activities may affect such
sites. That flow of information to Natural England, that it relies on to perform its regulatory and
other statutory functions, is in the public interest in that it better enables Natural England to ensure
that the natural environment is conserved, enhanced and managed.

You may apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision, if you remain unhappy with
the way we have dealt with your request. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: The
Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF.
Telephone: 01625 545 700, www.ico.qov.uk. The Information Commissioner normally expects
complaints to be made withirgtwo menths. of receipt of this letter.

Yours sincerely

Julie Lunt
Head of Legal Services
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Sent: 23 July 2008 14:54

To: 'rhalliday@duchyofcornwall.gov.uk’; ‘cmatthews@duchyofcornwall.gov.uk’

Cc: Ward, Janette (NE); Harrison, David (NE); Carter, Matthew (NE); Cook, Kevan (NE); McNair, Sangeeta (NE)
Subject: Duchy of Cornwal & Habitats Regulations

Roger and Chris

We have corresponded and discussed in the past whether the Duchy of Cornwall is a Relevant or
Competent Authority under the meaning of the 1994 Habitats Regulations. Your view is that the Duchy is
a landowner, rather than an authority, and is therefore not a relevant authority. Natural England is of the
view that since the Duchy is established by Act of Parliament, it falls into the definition of a relevent
authority.

Leaving aside the legal technicalities, there is some urgency to agreeing a resolution to this, particularly
around the Duchy of Cornwall Oyster Farm activities.in.the.Eal and Helford SAC.

We have received a Freedom of information Request relating to the activities of the oyster farm, and the
information we have had to supply makes:clear the gap in management. l.am concerned that the
reputation of the Duchy could be vulnerable if a third party were to complain to the European Commission
regarding management of the Fal and Helford SAC. This could lead to-the European Commission taking
infraction preceedings against the UK Gowvt, which would leave the Duchy vulnerable to criticism and
negative publicity.

| wonder whether it would be possibie to meet and discuss potential ways through the legisiative impasse.
This could be dealt with locally, or probably more appropriately at a national level.

I'm on leave from this afternoon until 19 August, but | wonder if we could arrange a meeting in late August
to discuss. While I'm away Sangeeta McNair will have access to my diary if you wish to check availability.

Best wishes

Roger

Roger Covey

Senior Marine Specialist

SW Regional Advocacy and Partnerships Team
Natural England

Pydar House

Pydar Street

Truro

TR1 1XU N

Phone 01872 245033
Mobile 07980 863094





